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Descarga las guías de Nest en español - Ayuda de Google Nest Descarga las versiones en español de la 
Guía del usuario, la Guía de instalación y la Guía de inicio rápido de los productos Nest. Haz clic en los 
siguientes vínculos para descargar las versiones en PDF de las Guías del usuario que se incluyen con los 
productos Nest. Algunos navegadores web pueden abrir archivos PDF, pero quizás .... Beginner's guide to 
the Nest thermostat - Google Nest Help Control your thermostat. Nest thermostats don’t have a touch screen. 
Use the touch bar on the right side to control your thermostat. Swipe up to raise the temperature, swipe down 
to lower it, and tap to confirm. The display will show you how many minutes until your desired temperature is 
reached.

Download documents included with your thermostat - Google Nest Help Nest Thermostat E. Installation 
Guide (11 pages, 0.5 MB) Nest Learning Thermostat (3rd gen) Installation Guide (12 pages, 0.3 MB) 
Welcome Guide (2 pages, 0.6 MB) Nest Learning Thermostat (2nd gen) Installation Guide (6 pages, 0.3 MB) 
Welcome Guide (10 pages, 1.7 MB) Nest Learning Thermostat (1st gen) Installation Guide (7 pages, 0.5 MB) 
Nest .... Download documents included with your thermostat - Google Nest Help Introducing Nest 
thermostats. Learn about the Nest Temperature Sensor. Technical specifications. Download documents 
included with your thermostat.

Beginner’s guide to the Nest thermostat - Google Nest Help As your Nest Learning Thermostat will be 
connected to high-voltage cables, you should have your thermostat professionally installed in order to keep 
you safe and avoid damaging your system or your Nest Learning Thermostat. Note: Nest Thermostat E is 
designed to easily replace most thermostats and most customers can install it themselves.. Install your Nest 
thermostat - Google Help 2. Set up your thermostat. 3. Get started using the Nest thermostat. Before you 
open the box. Make sure you’ve checked that your system will work with the Nest thermostat you’ve 
purchased. Check compatibility. A Nest Pro can make installation even easier. It’s easy to install a Nest 
thermostat yourself on most systems.

Control your Nest thermostat with the app - Google Help Nest app controls. Older Nest thermostats can be 
controlled with the Nest app and the Home app. Open the Nest app and tap your thermostat on the home 
screen. Your current and target temperatures will appear in the Nest app. To change the target temperature, 
drag your finger along the ring. To fine tune the temperature, tap the up or down arrow .... Get started with 
your Nest Thermostat and Nest Learning Thermostat (4th ... How to install and set up Nest Thermostat. 1. 
Get your tools ready. Pliers, needle nose pliers and wire strippers (optional) 2. Download the Google Home 
app. 3. Scan the QR code to add the thermostat in your home. : You’ll need to be able to touch your 
thermostat to add it to your account in the Home app.

Download documents included with your camera or doorbell Warranty, safety and regulatory information. Tips 
for respecting the privacy of others when using Nest products. Turn Nest camera on or off. How Home/Away 
Assist uses your phone’s location. Download documents included with your camera or doorbell. Nest Aware 
Emergency Calling Acceptable Use Policy. Return a Nest device.. Download documents included with your 
thermostat - Google Nest Help Nest Learning Thermostat (4th gen) Welcome Guide (22 pages, 3 MB) Nest 
Thermostat. Welcome Guide (8 pages, 7.16 MB) Quick Start Guide (2 pages, 0.7 MB) Nest Thermostat E. 
Installation Guide (11 pages, 0.5 MB) Nest Learning Thermostat (3rd gen) Installation Guide (12 pages, 0.3 
MB) Welcome Guide (2 pages, 0.6 MB) Nest Learning Thermostat (2nd gen)
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