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Insert a signature - Microsoft Support How to add a signature to your Word documents. You can also use the 
Signature Line command in Word to insert a line to show where to sign a document.. Enable or disable 
macros in Microsoft 365 files Make a document trusted to enable macros. If you see a security warning when 
you open a document or try to run a macro, you can choose to make it a trusted document and enable 
macros. This example is on an Excel workbook. Select Enable Content.

Obtain a digital certificate and create a digital signature Obtain a digital certificate and create a digital 
signature. This article explains how you can get or create a digital signature for use in Office documents. To 
learn more about how to use them in Office documents, see Add or remove a digital signature in Office files.. 
Digital signatures and certificates - Microsoft Support Digital signatures and certificates. More and more 
people and organizations are using digital documents instead of paper documents to conduct day-to-day 
transactions. By reducing dependency on paper documents, we are protecting the environment and saving 
the planet’s resources.

Add or remove a digital signature for Microsoft 365 files You can add invisible digital signatures to Word 
documents, Excel workbooks, and PowerPoint presentations. Signed documents will have the Signatures 
button at the bottom of the document. In addition, for signed documents, signature information appears in the 
Info section that you see after you click the File tab.. Insert a table of contents - Microsoft Support Word uses 
the headings in your document to build an automatic table of contents that can be updated when you change 
the heading text, sequence, or level. Click where you want to insert the table of contents – usually near the 
beginning of a document.

Keyboard shortcuts in Word - Microsoft Support For various ribbon options you can combine the Key Tips 
letters with the Alt key to make shortcuts called Access Keys. For example, press Alt+H to open the Home 
tab, and Alt+Q to move to the Tell Me or Search field. Press Alt again to see Key Tips for the options for the 
selected tab.. How to find and enable missing Copilot button in Microsoft 365 apps There are two settings 
here that can cause Copilot to not appear in your Microsoft 365 apps. First confirm that Experiences that 
analyze your content is turned on. Then scroll down and make sure that All connected experiences is turned 
on. Learn more.

Create a cross-reference - Microsoft Support A cross-reference allows you to link to other parts of the same 
document. For example, you might use a cross-reference to link to a chart or graphic that appears elsewhere 
in the document. The cross-reference appears as a link that takes the reader to the referenced item.. Use 
section breaks to change the layout or formatting in one section of ... You can use section breaks to change 
the layout or formatting of pages in your document. To change formatting in a document, insert a section 
break at the beginning of where you want the change. Set up the formatting change just past the new section 
break.
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Open file links directly in Office desktop apps - Microsoft Support This feature works for links to Word, Excel, 
or PowerPoint files, stored on OneDrive or SharePoint, that you click in Word, Excel, Outlook, or PowerPoint 
for Microsoft 365 on Windows or Mac. Once a user turns this feature on, it will apply to all three apps - Word, 
PowerPoint, and Excel.
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