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The Importance of Meal Planning - Dr. McDougall By keeping your meal plan straightforward, you can 
maintain consistency in your dietary habits, making it easier to adhere to a starch-based lifestyle and reap its 
numerous health benefits, such as improved digestion, increased energy levels and reduced risk of chronic 
diseases. The secret of the McDougall Program is to make starches the .... The McDougall Quick & Easy 
Cookbook - Dr. McDougall The McDougall Quick & Easy Cookbook. $ 24.99. Over 300 delicious starch-
based recipes you can prepare in 15 minutes or less. By using more canned and packaged products, Mary 
McDougall has put together some of the tastiest – and convenient – recipes you’ll ever eat. This cookbook 
includes snapshots of valuable nutritional, health and ...

The McDougall Health-Supporting Cookbook: Volume 2 The McDougall Health-Supporting Cookbook: 
Volume 2. $ 7.99. This book contains 100 days of menu ideas. There are suggestions on planning parties 
with buffet menus. Suggestions are provided on the proper use of a microwave. Plus a list of the favorite 
foods of all members of the McDougall family. To access the book download, you’ll be prompted .... 1 2 - D ay 
Mc D ou ga l l H e alth Menu 12-Day McDougall Health Menu. You will notice there are two options for each 
meal. The first option is “Mary’s Mini-McDougall Diet®”. This will always be the simplest and healthiest option. 
This is also a good option for those with food allergies or any other dietary restrictions. The second option will 
be a more involved recipe plan.

Shop Books, eBooks, Podcasts, & Videos | Dr. McDougall With a heavy heart, we share the news of Dr. John 
McDougall’s passing. A visionary physician and author, beloved husband, father, grandfather, brother, mentor 
and friend, Dr. McDougall died peacefully at his home on Saturday, June 22nd, at the age of 77. ... The 
McDougall Quick & Easy Cookbook . Over 300 delicious starch-based recipes you can .... Free McDougall 
Program - NEW - Dr. McDougall The McDougall Program provides you with the most powerful dose of 
medicine at least three times a day. It deals with the causes of disease, which means it is a true source of 
both prevention and healing. Give it a try and in 12 days you will start to see what it means to be healthy and 
fully alive. Learn more.

McDougall Made Irresistible Recipes Place 1?4 cup of the water in a large soup pot. Add the onion and garlic. 
Cook, stirring occasionally for 3-4 minutes, until softened. Add the ginger, paprika, cumin and several twists of 
freshly ground pepper. Mix in well, then add the remaining water, the lentils, garbanzos and tomatoes.. Plant-
Based Recipes - Dr. McDougall With a heavy heart, we share the news of Dr. John McDougall’s passing. A 
visionary physician and author, beloved husband, father, grandfather, brother, mentor and friend, Dr. 
McDougall died peacefully at his home on Saturday, June 22nd, at the age of 77. ... Download the McDougall 
Cookbook App to have all our delicious recipes in your pocket ...

Dr. McDougall's Health & Medical Center | Dr. McDougall The McDougall Program is a transformative and life-
saving 12-day online intensive program designed by Dr. McDougall. For over 35 years, this program has 
been helping individuals reverse chronic illness and take charge of their health. The McDougall Program is 
based on the concept of the Starch Solution, an innovative dietary approach that harnesses the benefits of 
eating whole-food, plant .... The McDougall Health-Supporting Cookbook: Volume 1 The McDougall Health-
Supporting Cookbook: Volume 1. $ 7.99. This book contains 250 of the McDougalls’ favorite recipes—with 
meals you can prepare ahead, quick and easy recipes, and meals for special occasions. There are 
suggestions for helping children change their diets. Many gluten-free recipes are included. To access the 
book download ...
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