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Ruby Guide - Chef Ruby is a simple programming language: Chef uses Ruby as its reference language to 
define the patterns that are found in resources, recipes, and cookbooks. Use these patterns to configure, 
deploy, and manage nodes across the network. Ruby is also a powerful and complete programming 
language: Use the Ruby programming language to make decisions .... About Policyfiles - Chef A Policyfile is 
a way to create immutable collections of cookbooks, cookbook dependencies, and attributes defined in a 
single document that is uploaded to the Chef Infra Server. The Policyfile is then associated with a group of 
nodes. When these nodes perform a Chef Infra Client run, they utilize recipes specified in the Policyfile.

Test Kitchen - Chef Documentation Test Kitchen. Use Test Kitchen to automatically test cookbooks across 
any combination of platforms and test suites: Test suites are defined in a kitchen.yml file. See the 
configuration documentation for options and syntax information. Supports cookbook testing across many 
cloud providers and virtualization technologies.. Chef Infra Overview Component Description; One (or more) 
workstations are configured to allow users to author, test, and maintain cookbooks. Workstation systems run 
the Chef Workstation package which includes tools such as Chef Infra Client, Chef InSpec, Test Kitchen, 
ChefSpec, Cookstyle, and other tools necessary for developing and testing your infrastructure with Chef 
products.

About Cookbook Versioning - Chef Metadata. Every cookbook requires a small amount of metadata. The 
contents of the metadata.rb file provides information that helps Chef Infra Client and Server correctly deploy 
cookbooks to each node.. A metadata.rb file is:. Located at the top level of a cookbook’s directory structure.. 
chef (executable) The chef executable is a command-line tool that does the following: Generates repositories, 
cookbooks, recipes, attributes, templates, and custom resources. Installs gems into the Chef development 
environment’s Ruby installation. Helps you manage your Policyfiles. Please refer the Policyfile commands 
section. Note.

About Recipes - Chef When the cookbook attributes take precedence over the default attributes, Chef Infra 
Client applies those new settings and values during a Chef Infra Client run on the node. Note Attributes can 
be configured in cookbooks (attribute files and recipes), roles, and environments.. cookbook_file Resource - 
Chef Use the cookbook_file resource to transfer files from a sub-directory of COOKBOOK_NAME/files/ to a 
specified path located on a host that is running Chef Infra Client. The file is selected according to file 
specificity, which allows different source files to be used based on the hostname, host platform (operating 
system, distro, or as appropriate), or platform version.

About Data Bags - Chef Data bags store global variables as JSON data. Data bags are indexed for searching 
and can be loaded by a cookbook or accessed during a search. Any search for a data bag (or a data bag 
item) must specify the name of the data bag and then provide the search query string that will be used during 
the search.. About Cookbooks - Chef Sous Chefs is a community organization that collaborates to maintain 
many of the most used Chef cookbooks. Cookbooks Maintained by the Community: The community has 
authored thousands of cookbooks, ranging from niche cookbooks that are used by only a few organizations to 
popular cookbooks used by almost everyone.
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